
Creating Presentations

When You Don’t Want To 
Look Like an Amateur



Pick a Platform

• This is Keynote!


• Prefer PowerPoint?


• Google Slides your go-to?


• Do you find emaze amazing?


• Prezi? HaikuDeck?


• Slideshare? Slides.com?



• Choose 
creatively


• Not your 
devices


• No gaming 
chairs 


• No mice


• No. Mice.

Pick a 
Product



Prepare to Prepare

• Good design is not an accident


• Good design is harder than it looks


• Good design should be invisible



Organize and 
Outline

• Take time to consider 
carefully


• What seems obvious to 
an expert may be utterly 
opaque to a novice


• Err on the side of too 
many details; you can 
edit out the trivia later



• Build first, decorate second


• Clean template = easy organization


• No distractions from the content

Nuts 
and 

Bolts



Bells 
and 

Whistles

• Match the theme to the topic


• Match the theme to your personal style


• Don’t use decorations as camouflage



Fonts and 
Colors

• Find resources online for 
font pairing and color 
palette building


• Let your topic inform 
your design style


• Pick and stick: changing 
fonts and colors with 
every slide is distracting



Images and 
Embeds

• Approach with 
caution: a little 
goes a long way


• Builds and 
transitions 
should be used 
as tools, not toys


• Audio can be 
especially 
tricky



Permissions and 
Citations

• Ask permission…not 
forgiveness


• There are plenty of 
resources explicitly labeled 
for re-use and/or 
modification


• When using copyrighted 
media with permission, be 
sure to cite creator



Revise and Refine

• Edit


• Go back and edit again


• Seriously, edit at least twice more



Practice3
• The only way to 

guarantee a good 
performance is to 
perform


• Out loud


• With an audience 


• As opposed to 
relaxing in a chair 
reading it silently 
to yourself...over 
and over



Collaborate• Help each 
other out


• Be 
constructive, 
but be honest


• Be receptive, 
but stay 
confident and�

Critique



Export and Submit

• Sign up for a presentation 
time slot! 


• Make sure that everyone 
can share the slides in the 
Zoom


• Export slides to .pdf (no 
other file format accepted!)


• Submit slide deck .pdf via 
Blackboard prior to the due 
date


